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ABOUT SAT

TYPES OF SAT

Conducted by the College Board, SAT-1 or more commonly referred to as the Scholastic 
Assessment Test, is required to be taken by the students seeking admission in to undergraduate 
schools. SAT-1 is a general test that has been developed to evaluate the written, verbal and 
mathematical skills of the candidates. SAT-2, on the other hand, is a more subject-focused test. 
Students looking to get admission to a particular course are required to take the SAT Subject Test to 
demonstrate their knowledge of that particular subject. 

WHAT IS ACT? 

WHAT IS ACT?The ACT, originally an abbreviation of American College Testing, is a standardized 
test used for College admissions in the United States. It is currently administered by ACT, a non-
profit organization of the same name. The ACT test covers four academic skill areas: English, 
Mathematics, Reading & Science Reasoning. It also offers an optional direct writing test. It is 
accepted by all four-year Collegesand Universities in the United States and more than 225 
Universities outside the U.S.

The main four ACT test sections are individually scored on a scale of 1-36, and a composite score 
(the rounded whole number average of the four sections) is provided.

Many students and parents begin the College prep process by comparing the ACT and SAT tests. 
The SAT and ACT generally cover the same topics. Both ACT and SAT scores are used for College 
admissions decisions and awarding merit-based scholarships. Most Colleges do not prefer one test 
over the other. Neither the SAT or the ACT is harder than the other. Different students tend to do 
better on one test over the other.

SAT is an international standardized test conducted for getting admission in the Colleges of the 
United States and many other countries. SAT is wholly owned, developed, administered and 
published by the College Board. The full form of SAT is the Scholastic Assessment Test which was 
earlier known as the Scholastic Aptitude Test. 

The purpose of SAT is to measure a high school student's readiness for College, and provide 
Colleges with one common data point that can be used to compare all applicants' academic 
potential. 
It is a multiple choice, pencil-and-paper test. It is designed for high school students looking for 
College education by testing their ability to solve the problems. Applicants aspiring to pursue 
undergraduate courses, particularly in the U.S. and Canada, are required to take the SAT exam. 
This exam evaluates the candidates on their written, verbal and mathematical skills. The SAT Subject 
tests are offered in areas like Literature, History, Mathematics, Sciences and Foreign Languages. 
Its score is also accepted in countries like United Kingdom, Australia, Singapore and Canada. It is 
held 5 times a year in most of the countries. 



OUR SAT STUDY

PACKAGES

ENGLISH ASSESSMENT TEST

TIMED MOCK TESTS 10

VOCAB, GRAMMAR, SAT TIP VIDEOS 300+

INSTANT RESULTS FOR MAIN TESTS

ESSAY RESULTS BY EXPERT MENTORS

Sectional Test

Sectional Test - Writing and Language

4

Sectional Test - With Calculator

15

Sectional Test - No Calculator

15

Sectional Test - Reading

4

Sectional Test - Active Reading & 

Summary Writing  4

1. SAT MOCK TEST PACKAGE
Our Mock Tests package comprises of preparatory video lessons for Grammar, Vocabulary and SAT 

foundation building, along with timed Mock tests placed on AI powered simulated test engine, to give 

your students the look and feel of the real SAT test. Moreover, the content has been created by expert 

SAT trainers, with experience of training more than 10,000 students till date. 



OUR SAT STUDY

PACKAGES

ENGLISH ASSESSMENT TEST

TIMED MOCK TESTS 10

VOCAB, GRAMMAR, SAT TIP VIDEOS 300+

LIVE LECTURE CURRICULUM 12 WEEKS

MAXIMUM STUDENTS PER LIVE LECTURE NA

INSTANT RESULTS FOR MAIN TESTS

ESSAY RESULTS BY EXPERT MENTORS

BOOKS

60 MINUTES

VERBAL & QUANT EACH

4 Barron’s Books

Saturday Doubt Solving Sessions

VERBAL : 08:00 AM - 09:00 AM 

MATH   : 09:30 AM - 10:30 AM

ROLLING BATCHES ENROLL ANY DAY, ANYTIME 

TIMINGS  (Monday to Friday) 

VERBAL : 07:30 AM - 08:30 AM & 06:00 PM - 07:00 PM

MATH     : 09:00 AM - 10:00 AM & 07:30 PM - 08:30 PM

 

LIVE LECTURES DURATION

Sectional Test 

In addition to our offerings in the SAT Mock Test Package, our SAT LIVE Regular 

Package consists of Live Lectures conducted by our expert trainers, along with 

4 original SAT Barron’s books for the students, allowing them to have a complete 

understanding of the test and have doubt solving sessions.

2. SAT LIVE REGULAR

Sectional Test - Writing and Language

4

Sectional Test - With Calculator

15

Sectional Test - No Calculator

15

Sectional Test - Reading

4

Sectional Test - Active Reading & 

Summary Writing  4

HO: 305 & 306, Krishna Corn Arch - 4, Opp. Sinhar School, Nr HP Petrol Pump, University Road, Rajkot 360005

 W.: www.theglobeinternational.com Link: elearning.theglobeinternational.com Email: info@theglobeinternational.com
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